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1
1" X 3" Band Strips (Must be Starline, 

Curity Covidien or Coverlette)
13 50 or 100 bx 3.19 1423039 8.41 1041351

2
3/4" X 3" Band Aid Strips (Must be 

Starline, Curity Covidien or Coverlette)
8 50 or 100 bx 3.64 1423038 7.19 1041349

3 Fabric 1" x 3" Band aids 17 1,500 bx 42.60 1271236 32.25 32076

4 Fabric Band Aid Strips 1"x3", 3/4"x3" 7 1,500 bx 25.82 1271242 27.35 32073

5 Fabric Band Aids Ex. Lg:  2"x4" 9 1,500 bx 97.35 1311502 4.07 32120

6
2" x 4" XLG Band Aid Strips (Must be 

Starline, Curity Covidien or Coverlette)
1 50 or 100 bx 7.45 1423050 13.00 1041359

7 Junior Band Aid 5/8 x 2 ¼ 3 50 or 100 bx 1.49 2617568 2.23 32229

8
Knuckle Winged Band Aids (Must be 

Starline, Curity Covidien or Coverlette)
14 50 or 100 bx 6.55 1423055 13.00 1041360

9

Fabric Winged Fingertip Band Aids (Must 

be Starline, Curity Covidien or 

Coverlette)

9 50 or 100 bx
7.16 1423052 18.21 1041354

10

Bandages 1 1/4" oval spots latex free 

(Must be Starline, Curity Covidien or 

Coverlette)

6 50 or 100 bx
5.17 1423046 7.63 1041358

11 Circle Spot Band Aid 4 50 or 100 bx 0.82 1126143 1.84 32042

12 Telfa Adhesive Pads 3" x 4" 7 50 or 100 bx 24.61 8909112 14.83 27530

13 Non-sterile pads Gauze 2 x 2" 11 200/bag 0.70 5702597 1.05 27536

14 Non-sterile pads Gauze 4 x 4" 30 200/bag 2.88 5702656 2.86 27541
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15 Sterile 4x4 gauze 2-ply 1 100/box 6.12 5702649 7.42 27544

16 Ace Wrap Bandage 2" 7 12 / bag 2.73 9004677 7.49 31123

17 Ace Wrap Bandage 3" 7 12 / bag 3.42 9004678 8.71 31124

18
Non-sterile Conforming Stretch Gauze 2" 

roll
18 12 / bag 1.44 1048825 1.96 27082

19
Non-sterile Conforming Stretch Gauze 3" 

roll
1 12 / bag 1.60 1048997 1.91 27083

20
Non-sterile Conforming Stretch Gauze 4" 

roll
4 12 / bag 2.14 1042728 3.33 27084

21 5" or 6" Curley Fluff/ Curlex Rolls 3 12 / bag no bid no bid

22 Flexible Cohesive Wrap 2"x 6 yards 22 12 / bag 24.80 6489088 1.50 28414

23 Calamine Lotion 9
standard size 

available 2.57 1381188 2.58 1034910

24 Anti-itch solution (Dyphenhydramine) 2
standard size 

available no bid no bid 6.85 1034505

25 A&D Ointment 2 oz. tube 7
standard size 

available 1.40 1407640 no bid

26 Topical Burn Gel (aloe with Lidocaine) 2 each 6.88 1388601 6.52 43056

27 Alcohol Isopropyl (16 oz. bottle) 1
standard size 

available 1.51 1127067 2.54 1039746

28 Alcohol Prep Pads 24 180 box 1.28 5702219 2.42 1040441

29 Bacitracin Ointment Tube 15
standard size 

available 1.40 1278459 1.59 43009
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30 Bacitracin Ointment-foil packs - 144/bx 2 144/box 6.42 1419947 21.68 1040248

31 Antiseptic Individual Towelettes (PAWS) 12 100 bx 5.26 4226029 3.06 49173

32 Steri-strips1/8” X 3”: 4 strips/pack 4 50 box 42.15 7776538 11.54 28138

33 Vaseline large tub 13 oz. 6 tub 5.33 1234850 4.12 1039736

34 Vaseline Tube each 0.87 1948259 1.94 43026

35 Caladryl Clear – Generic 15 4 oz. 3.38 1381568 6.63 43375

36 Peroxide 10 blt 0.60 1127069 1.30 34011

37 Saline Rinse for Wounds 38 4 oz. 7.17 1175782 11.06 1039731

38 Aloe Vera Gel 7 each 6.75 1235002 5.05 43328

39 Acetaminophen 325 mg tabs 21 1000 btl 11.17 1432826 4.94 1041482

40 Acetaminophen 500 mg tabs 1 1000 btl 14.24 1407611 no bid

41 Acetaminophen 500 mg tabs 4 100 btl 2.51 1338132 8.64 44308

42 Acetaminophen Children liquid 34 4 oz. 5.20 1400325 no bid

43 Benadryl tabs (25mg. Ea.) 6 100 tabs 21.92 3211667 2.47 44359

44 Benadryl Allergy Liquid 8 4 oz. 7.09 1359026 4.74 1007718

45 Diphenhydramine Children Liquid 6 4 oz. 1.49 1381123 4.74 1007718

46 Chewable Aspirin 5 24 tabs 0.87 1381092 no bid

47 Ibuprofen 200 mg bottle 18 1000 btl 13.72 1045529 no bid

48 Ibuprofen 200 mg bottle 6 100 btl 2.27 1044367 2.08 1039823

PAIN RELIEVERS & ALLERGY MEDICINE & COUGH/COLD & 

CREAMS
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49 Tums 17 btl 6.39 9300012 3.55 44337

50 Cough Drops – menthol 413 bag 6.58 8393443 3.46 44075

51 Non Latex PF Vinyl Gloves Lg 37 100/box 4.76 5700090 5.63 1040768

52 Non Latex PF Vinyl Gloves Med 227 100/box 4.76 5700089 5.63 1040767

53 Non Latex PF Vinyl Gloves Sm 25 100/box 4.76 5700088 5.63 1040766

54 Non Latex PF Vinyl Gloves XL 117 100/box 4.76 5700091 5.63 1040769

55
Applicator Sticks - plain cotton 6" non-

sterile
5 1000/box 7.51 1009175 2.75 90985

56 Silk Cloth Surgical Tape 2" 4 4 rolls/box 1 10.22 1015979 no bid

57 Durapore Surgical Tape 1" 3 12 rolls/box 1 10.22 1012323 13.58 28112

58 Tongue depressors-regular 3 1,000/box 1 7.62 1002416 7.30 90022

59 Individual cotton tipped applicator sticks 8 100/box 2.65 5820005 8.71 90260

60 Assorted Finger Splints 8 standard unit 37.63 6107865 48.58 20009

61 Silk Cloth Surgical Tape 2" 4 rolls/box 1 10.22 1015979 no bid

62 Silk Cloth tape latex free 1" - Economy 2 12 rolls/box 1 10.22 1012323 8.92 28281

GLOVES:  ALL MUST BE  LATEX-FREE AND THE FOLLOWING 

BRANDS FOR ALL SIZES:  MCKESSON, DYNAREX SAFE TOUCH, 

MICROFLEX ULTRA SENSE, OR PRO-ADVANTAGE BY NDC

APPLICATORS & SPLINTS & TAPES
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63 Durapore Surgical Tape 1" 4 12 rolls/box 1 8.95 7772892 13.58 28112

64 Durapore Surgical Tape 3" 2 4 rolls/box 1 8.95 7779487 no bid

65 Durapore Surgical Tape 1/2" 4 24 rolls/box 1 8.95 7776047 13.54 28111

66
Kendall Curity Hypoallergenic Clear 

Tape 1"
12 rolls/box 1 8.65 8407874 no bd

67 Cotton Balls Large  8 100 or 200/bag no bid 2.73 30015

68 Plain cotton  non-sterile applicator sticks 2 100/pkg 1 8.49 1204772 0.51 99303

69 Reusable arm splint - Large 4 standard unit 18.91 4990807 3.39 20197

70 Reusable arm splint - Small 5 standard unit 18.20 4990808 3.39 20195

71
ADC Adtemp "ultra fast" Temple Touch 

Thermometer
1 Each 7.72 1328662 19.37 13116

72 DMI Infrared no-touch thermometer Each 19.59 1378299 47.99 1030386

73

Thermometer Probe Covers #05031 for 

Welch-Allyn Sure Temp PLUS digital 

thermometer Model 679.  

13 200 box
8.81 5660460 10.69 21431

74 Exergen Thermometer Probe Cover 50 per box no bid 4.83 21250

75
Welch-Allyn Sure Temp PLUS Digital 

Thermometer
Each no bid 2033856 332.88 13071

76 Pulse Oximeter: spot check finger tip 8 Each no bid 9006368 45.54 53249

77 Ear Specula 4.0, 2.5 201 Each no bid no bid

EPI-PENS & TESTERS & RELATED SUPPLIES

THERMOMETERS & OTOSCOPES & RELATED SUPPLIES



PRICE 

PER UNIT

MFG # 

ORDER

PRICE 

PER UNIT

MFG # 

ORDER

PRICE 

PER UNIT

MFG # 

ORDER

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED  

QUANTITIES
UNIT

SCHOOL HEALTH 

CORPORATION

5600 Apollo Dr.

Rolling Meadows, IL 

60008

bids@schoolhealth.com

T: 866-323-5465

F: 800-235-1305

MANSFIELD PAPER 

CO                                   

380 Union Street, West 

Springfield, MA  01090  

T:413-781-2000 F:413-

785-0856 

purchasing@mansfieldp

aper.com

HENRY SCHEIN 

MEDICAL

135 Duryea Road

Melville, NY  11747

athleticsandschools@He

nrySchein.com

T: 800-851-0400

F: 631-419-3403

NURSING SUPPLIES BID #2024-07 RESULTS

78 EpiPens: 0.3 mg adult auto injector 1 set of 2 283.54 1279954 425.52 1037705

79
Bayer Contour Blood Glucose Strips Item 

#7099IM (Box of 50)
50 box 16.92 1336172 no bid

80
Stat-let auto safety lancet tender 28GA 

1.8mm depth
100 box 8.84 9007991 no bid

81
Syringe: 1 cc.  W 1/2 "  27G or 28G  

needle
100/box 4.62 9873790 no bid

82 Instaglucose gel (hypoglycemic agent) 10 small tube 18.98 1235472 no bid

83 Eye Irrigation solution/sterile isotonic 40 4 oz. btl 2.30 1514399 2.48 34105

84 Contact Lens Solution 6 12 oz. 5.10 1234952 5.11 34232

85 Eye Wash Cups (Unsterile) 3 dz. no bid 3.79 91086

86 Orthodontic wax 10 1 small pack 26.51
1068541 1.08 47009

87 Mouthwash 1 16 oz. 8.24 2222379 1.60 34242

88 Toothpaste 15 1.5 oz. 9.67 5430132 0.88 47012

89 Dental Floss 12 pkg 4.07 2810082 0.54 47041

90 Toothettes Unflavored or flavored 4 250/box 37.04 6664448 no bid

91 Purell Instant Hand Sanitizer 104 8 oz. 4.11 5900066 4.55 34235

92 Hand Sanitizer - Generic 8 oz. 6.52 9004442 1.05 34397

SOAP & LOTIONS & WIPES

EYE WASH & RELATED SUPPLIES

ORAL HYGIENE & RELATED SUPPLIES
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93
Hand lotion: UNSCENTED 

Hypoallergenic
12 10 oz. 8.71 7772153 no bid

94 Hand Soap 4 56 oz. no bid no bid no bid

95 White lotion hand soap gallon 22.42 1208772 25.15 34555

96 Dial Deodorant sample size 100 standard small 1.72
6490057 1.80 44092

97 Thin Maxi Pads Individual by the case 8 1 case no bid 106.84 22008

98 Tendersorb Underpad 23x36 2 150 case 35.60 8906517 47.34 27726

99 Baby Wipes 1 240 pkg 2.53 6025044 2.94 1040442

100 Baby Wipes 27 704 case 36.45 1243087 2.94 1040442

101 Kleenex type tissues 100 tissues/box  6 36 boxes/case 58.68

1002649 74.07 1030642

102 Kleenex type tissues 125 tissues/box  2 48 boxes/case 84.48

6437651 2.39 21296

103 Tampax Tampons individual, regular 5 500/case 119.06 1400398 69.40 1041619

104
Reusable cold/hot packs latex free 3" x 

5" (type that are used in coolers - hard)
13 12 or 24/box no bid

7.68 37193

HOT COLD PACKS 

FEMININE HYGIENE, TISSUES & RELATED
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105
Reusable cold/hot packs latex free 4" x 

6" 
28 12 or 24/box 22.08

5702140 5.50 1039639

106 Instant Cold Compress 6x9 24/cs 17 12 or 24/case 21.76 1126145 10.34 37271

107 Plastic Zip Loc Bags - Gallon - Generic 10 Box 7.54 1190324 4.59 21356

108 Plastic Zip Loc Bags - Quart - Generic 23 Box 3.16 1190314 7.39 21003

109 Plastic Medicine Cups  / 1 oz/30 ml. 20 100/bag 1.31 1125555 1.06 21004

110 6 oz. paper/plastic drinking water cup 44 100 box 4.30 1018596 no bid

111
3 oz. wax Dixie drinking cups (not 

clear/transparent)
35 100 ct 13.94 1396520 5.22 21209

112 Paper bedside table mini trash bags 100 no bid no bid

113 Paper Souffle cups 3/4 oz. 5 250/box no bid no bid

114 Ticked off tick remover 6 each 30.87 1365797 4.21 90451

115
Disinfectant deodorizing spray (Lysol 

type)
12 each 20.10 3588587 11.92 1020219

116
Clean-up surface wipes: Clorox or 

comparable
54

tubs of 100 to 200 

wipes
5.90

1066794 6.96 49187

LICE & TICK

FIRST AID AND MISCELLANEOUS 

CUPS & BAGS
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117
Spill-Kit EZ Clean up (blood pathogen 

clean up kit)
4 1 ea. 7.18 6920180 19.05 90109

118
Non-Molded surgical masks with Ear 

Loops
50/box 5.50 1043809 4.19 1040216

119 Manicure Sticks 1 144/box 4.06 6350148 no bid

120 Emery Boards 2 144/box 6.20 8240403 no bid

121 Disposable Isolation Gowns 1 50/case 63.42 1012849 30.99 21047

122 Child Blood Pressure Cuff each 10.91 1126076 14.14 56335

123 CPR Mask 9 each 5.12 4995174 10.30 59701

124 Penlights individual (reusable) 1 each 2.63 1162165 6.71 91326

125 Disposable Sharps Container 2 5.4 qt. 6.44 1127151 10.09 90129

126 Pillow cases 2 1 2.35 6357676 2.55 48020

127 Pillows (standard size) 8 1 8.71 3190001 14.17 48002

128 Finger Nail Clippers 7 each 0.80 8401531 0.98 36071

129
Trauma Sheers/Scissors (bandage 5 

1/2")
6 each 3.54 3789251 1.23 36233

130 Fine Point Tweezers 1 each 3.20 1271927 0.79 36046

131 Slant Point Tweezers 3 each 1.11 3787700 1.54 36241

132 Tourniquet Roll 10 Standard 24.59 5470214 0.25 27717


