
 LPVEC BID RECAP, Gasoline, May 4, 2023
BIDDER #1 BIDDER #2 BIDDER #3 BIDDER #4 BIDDER #5 BIDDER #6

Trailer Transport Burke Buckley Global

Section: 1 Franklin, Hampsh
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon

Option 1. Trailer Load $0.0425 $0.1996 $0.5889

Option 1. Less than TL $0.1025 $0.4500 No Bid

Option 2. Trailer Load $0.2425 no bid $0.7146

Option 2. Less than TL $0.3025 No Bid No Bid
Weighted Ave. Price  (25% 
to each margin.) $0.1725000 Bid Disqualified Bid Disqualified
Non Collusion x x
Tax Compliance Certificate x x
Insurance Certificate x x
References x x
Financial Statement x x
Bid Deposit x x
Bid Signed? x x

LPVEC BID RECAP, Gasoline, May 4, 2023
BIDDER #1 BIDDER #2 BIDDER #3 BIDDER #4 BIDDER #5 BIDDER #6

Trailer Transport Burke Buckley Global

Section: 2 Hampden
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon

Option 1. Trailer Load $0.0365 $0.1996 $0.5889

Option 1. Less than TL $0.0965 $0.4500 No Bid

Option 2. Trailer Load $0.2365 no bid $0.7148

Option 2. Less than TL $0.2965 No Bid No Bid
Weighted Ave. Price  (25% 
to each margin.) $0.1665000 Bid Disqualified Bid Disqualified
Non Collusion x x
Tax Compliance Certificate x x
Insurance Certificate x x
References x x
Financial Statement x x
Bid Deposit x x
Bid Signed? x x



 LPVEC BID RECAP, Gasoline, May 4, 2023
BIDDER #1 BIDDER #2 BIDDER #3 BIDDER #4 BIDDER #5

    Metered Pump Truck Burke Buckley Global

Section: 3
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon

Option 1. Daily $0.1815 No Bid No Bid

Option 2. Fixed $0.2815 No Bid No Bid
Weighted Ave. Price  (50% 
to each margin.) $0.2315000
Non Collusion x x
Tax Compliance Certificate x x
Insurance Certificate x x
References x x
Financial Statement x x
Bid Deposit x x
Bid Signed? x x


