
 LPVEC BID RECAP, Diesel Fuel, May 4, 2023
BIDDER #1 BIDDER #2 BIDDER #3 BIDDER #4 BIDDER #5 BIDDER #6

Trailer Transport Dennis K. Burke Global Santa Buckley Sprague

Section: 1
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon

Option 1. Daily $0.0425 $0.2668 $0.2196 $0.1616

Option 2. Fixed FY2018 $0.1725 $0.4129 NO BID $0.2508
Weighted Ave. Price  (40% 
Opt 1. 60% Opt 2.) $0.1205000 $0.3544600 #VALUE! $0.2151200
Non Collusion x x x x
Tax Compliance Certificate x x x x
Insurance Certificate x x x x
References x x x x
Financial Statement x x x x
Bid Deposit x x x x
Bid Signed? x x x x

LPVEC BID RECAP, Diesel Fuel, May 4, 2023
BIDDER #1 BIDDER #2 BIDDER #3 BIDDER #4 BIDDER #5

 Franklin County  Metered 
Pump Truck Burke Global Santa Buckley Sprague

Section: 2
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon

Option 1. Daily $0.3795 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Option 2. Fixed FY2018 $0.4995
Weighted Ave. Price  (40% 
Opt 1. 60% Opt 2.) $0.4515000
Non Collusion x x x x
Tax Compliance Certificate x x x x
Insurance Certificate x x x x
References x x x x
Financial Statement x x x x
Bid Deposit x x x x
Bid Signed? x x x x



 LPVEC BID RECAP, Diesel Fuel, May 4, 2023
BIDDER #1 BIDDER #2 BIDDER #3 BIDDER #4 BIDDER #5

 Hampshire County  
Metered Pump Truck Burke Global Santa Buckley Sprague

Section: 3
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon

Option 1. Daily $0.1395 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Option 2. Fixed FY2018 $0.2695
Weighted Ave. Price  (40% 
Opt 1. 60% Opt 2.) $0.2175000
Non Collusion x x x x
Tax Compliance Certificate x x x x
Insurance Certificate x x x x
References x x x x
Financial Statement x x x x
Bid Deposit x x x x
Bid Signed? x x x x

 LPVEC BID RECAP, Diesel Fuel, May 4, 2023
BIDDER #1 BIDDER #2 BIDDER #3 BIDDER #4 BIDDER #5

 Hampden County  
Metered Pump Truck Burke Global Santa Buckley Sprague

Section: 4
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon
Margin & Overhead $ 

Per Gallon

Option 1. Daily $0.1095 NO BID NO BID $0.2285

Option 2. Fixed FY2018 $0.2395 $0.2638
Weighted Ave. Price  (40% 
Opt 1. 60% Opt 2.) $0.1875000 $0.2496800
Non Collusion x x x x
Tax Compliance Certificate x x x x
Insurance Certificate x x x x
References x x x x
Financial Statement x x x x
Bid Deposit x x x x
Bid Signed? x x x x


